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Email Tutorial Overview...

1. How to access LinkPoint from Lotus Notes.

2. How to record an outbound email from Lotus
Notes to salesforce.com.

3. How to record an inbound email from Lotus Notes
to salesforce.com.
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Step 1

How to access LinkPoint
from Lotus Notes.
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@i CRM Address.. o ] 21|
File Edit WView Create ‘ Actions Text Help
03 [H&~ (| 5¢ AddRedpients C = &4 ]
T Archive » ¥
] Rdees CRM Address... Jle-o - 0R-|
J l Send Memo to Database Manager CRM Send

Wel = Synchronize Address Book CRM Send and File
= ome | L) Upgrade Folder Design Record to CRM

% LinkPoint = || Sen Edit Address... || Delivery Options... || Tools =

: T Send
' SendandFile... To ||
B save AsDraft or |
Address...
bee
Delivery Options... |
Tools Subject |

Show Additional Mail Options

BEdgyY @dcas

Edit HTML Attributes
Preview In Web Browser

List of primary people to send message.

A] ['.—.{3 A] [x[}isconneded A] [Pntemet 4] [I:I A]

There are 4 LinkPoint menu’s available
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@i CRM Address..
File Edit View Create | Actions Text Help

&, E? - = = Add Redpients »
T Archive »

| A T

J l Send Memo to Database Manager CRM Send

= Synchronize Address Book CRM Send and File
L EEME [Pl Upgrade Folder Design Record to CRM

LinkPoint = @ Edit Address...]'[DeliveryOptions...][Tools']

Send
Send and File... To ||
B save AsDraft oo |
Adt_iress... . e |
Delivery Options...
Tools Subject |

Show Additional Mail Options

Edit HTML Attributes
Preview In Web Browser

a
E}
|
=
@
=
&l
=
it
By

CRM Address...

=== 1his allows you to lookup your Contacts
- and Leads directly from salesforce.com
and use them as recipients in your
Email.
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i CRM Send
File Edit View Create | Actions Text Help
O HE~ (& AddRecpients ,

Archive L4
| padess Jli<=
J l Send Memo to Database Manager
Synchronize Address Book Qi
=
i) Upgrade Folder Design Record to CRM

% LinkPoint~ || Sen . Address... || Delivery Options... || Tools =

'rﬂ Send |
Send and File... To

0{ save AsDraft o |

Address... ok |

Delivery Cptions. ..

Tools Subject |

Show Additional Mail Options.

Edit HTML Attributes
Preview In Web Browser

@
5|
&l
@
W
=
S
T
By

List of primary people to senc CRM Send
=)

This will send your email via Lotus
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M Send and File ;IQIEI
Edit View Create | Actions Text Help
[CRE- [G& Addrecpens ’ - 7L
Archive »

— cuasges.. | Jle-= - 0a ]

J ] Send Memo to Database Manager Mool

Synchronize Address Book
B o

Upgrade Folder Design P ]

(=4 || Linkraint = |[ sen - Address.. || Delivery Options...

= Send

1

8 L Send and File... To |

0 save AsDraft o |
Address...

lress . ok |

Delivery Options...
Tools Subject |

Show Additional Mail Options

Edit HTML Attributes
Preview In Web Browser

@
|
&l
@
W
&l
=
il
=

CRM Send and File

List of primary people to sent

- This will send your email via Lotus
Notes, file it in a folder in Lotus Notes
and record it to salesforce.com.
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Actions Text Help
J OB~ (& AddRedpients

Archive

| e G .

J ] Send Memo to Database Manager CRM Send

Synchronize Address Book
B o

Upgrade Folder Design

4 -

»

e S

% Sen o

= Send

18 L Send and File...

0 saye AsDraft
Address...
Delivery Options...
Tools

Show Additional Mail Options

wevery wptions...

To |

o |

bes |

Subject |

Edit HTML Attributes
Preview In Web Browser

@
|
&l
@
W
&l
=
il
=

List of primary people to sent

<[
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Record to CRM

This will record an inbound email or
previously sent email to salesforce.com




Step 2

How to record an Outbound email
from Lotus Notes to salesforce.com.
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{f) Test Outbound Email - Lotus Notes o ] 1|

|File Edit View Create Actions Text Help
GRS DS B B oot s ~[10~[B I 4 T -PET Yo
| Address O]

] |

Welcome | (3 Test User - Inbox 3¢ @Test Outbound Email ¢

[ |[ Linkpaint ~ Send and File... || Save As Draft Delivery Optins..

B

18 Test User/Test User o |
08/24/2006 08:37 AM

o |
bec |
Subject |

@
5|
&l
@
=
3
S
il
=

Body of message

A] [d}) A] [x[}isconneded 4] [Intemet A] [I:I A]

Start a New Memo
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@i CRM Address..

File Edit Wiew Create | Actions Text Help
[CHS- D& Adreens ’ - #v |
Archive »

-+
e GR Adres.. e~=- 0]

J l Send Memo to Database Manager CRM Send

= Synchronize Address Book CRM Send and File
£ come | G- Upgrade Folder Design Record to CRM

% LinkPoint = || Sen Edit Address... || Delivery Options... || Tools =

= Send
1
s ' SendandFile... To ||
B save AsDraft oo |
Address...
e bee |
Delivery Options...
Tools Subject |

Show Additional Mail Options

Edit HTML Attributes
Preview In Web Browser

E}
|
=
@
=
&l
=
it
By

You can address the email by typing an
meemaemeseen €mail address, selecting a recipient
- from your Lotus Notes address book, or

by using the LinkPoint salesforce.com
Address book.
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{f) Test Outbound Email - Lotus Notes o ] 1|

File Edit View Create Actions Text Help

| CH&S- 23|

ﬂ%]] Default Sans Seri |10 |~|B I #oe==:

~StiaBE @ D6V L]

1
z
K

J Address

- - o]

|

l

)
@
5|
&l
@
=
3
S
T
=

JQ Welcome I@ Test User - Inbox XI @Test Outbound Email x]

| LinkPoint ~ || Send || Send and File... || Save As Draft || address... || Delivery Options... || Toals ~ |

Test User/Test User
08/24/2006 08:37 AM

) Select Email Address - for Salesforce [ Lotus Notes

Search Foi |sm'rth

- [ Search Result:32 -

[ Smith, Jonathan
[ Smith, Kevin
[ Smith, Kevin

M1 Smith, Paul
Select All

||

De-Select All |

Smith, Knis {Contact)
bedrock inc
kris smith@&lp.com

To|

oc |

Search |

—Recipients: 1
=1 Ta:

42, Smith, Kris {kris smith@lp .com})
=1 cc:

=1 bee:

Remaove

Smith, Knis {Contact)
bedrock inc
keris smith @lp.com

~ Enter any part of a Contact last name or

Body of message emall address and CIICk “SearCh".
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o LinkPoint will return all Contacts
containing the search criteria.




{f) Test Outbound Email - Lotus Notes o ] 1|

File Edit View Create Actions Text Help

J{}éﬂ@@@” ﬂ%]] Default Sans Serif | ~-|B I #+ vEIégE(é@MT?EE]

J Address
] l
JQ Welcome I@ Test User - Inbox XI @Test Outbound Email x]

| LinkPoint ~ || Send || Send and File... || Save As Draft || address... || Delivery Options... || Toals ~ |

Test User/Test User To |

NRIFAIINNE NR-TT7 AR [
) Select Email Address - for Salesforce [ Lotus Notes

Search For: [smith

—Search Result:32 —Rercinients: 1
3 Smith. J = To:
[ Smith, Jemy "2, Smith, Kris (kris smith@lp.com)
D Smith, John =1 cc:
3 Smith. John 4 hees
[ Smith, Jonathan
[ Smith, Kevin

e

[ Smith, Lucian
[ Smith, Markus
[ Smith, Matt
[ Smith, Mike
[ Smith, Nathan
M1 Smith, Paul

Select All De-Select All | Remaove Remove All

)
@
5|
&l
@
=
3
S
T
=

Smith, Knis {Contact) Smith, Knis {Contact)
bedrock inc bedrock inc
kris smith@&lp.com keris smith @lp.com

Body of message

- You can select the Contact or Lead and
click the “To”, “CC”, or “BCC” to move
the Contact or Lead to the recipient list.
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~ioi

File Edit View Create Actons Text Help

|C RS~ B3| 5| vefauksans et ~[10  ~|B T F+ t4n B @ D144 Y |
Address ” =S

] |
JQ Welcome ]@Test User - Inbax X] @ New Mema xl

[ LinkPoint '] [ Send ][Send and File... ] [ Save As Draﬂ] [Address... ] [ Delivery Options... ] [Tools ']

Test User/Test User To |kri5.5mith@lp.com
02112/2007 08:28 AM x

cc |
bee |
Subject |testoutb-ound email

This is a test outbound email

a
@
ka
=
@
™
&
=
m
=

Body of message
A] [1:3 A] [xDisconneded *] [Irlteme‘t

The recipients are placed in the
appropriate fields and you can continue

typing your email.
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@ CRM Address .
| Gle Edit View Create | Actions Text Help

J{}%v [5)£ AddRedpients » v||; T
Archive »

| pass ) =" —

J l Send Memo to Database Manager CRM Send

= Synchronize Address Book CRM Send and File
= e = Upgrade Folder Design Record to CRM

@ LinkPoint = || Sen Edit Address... [| Delivery Options..
o Send
=L

T Send and Fie... To |kri5.5mith@|p.com

0 Save As Draft oo |
Address...

.;ess _ i |
Delivery Options... :
Toolz bject |test outbound email
Show Additional Mail Options.

Thisis atestc  ggip . Attributes
- Preview In Web Browser

]
@
ka
=
@
3
&l
3
i
=

This is the protected text area of the form.

- To send the email and record it to
salesforce.com, select “Actions”,
“LinkPoint”, then click the “CRM Send”
or “CRM Send and File” menu option.
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m Hew Memo - Lotus Notes

File Edit View Create Actions Text Help
CRE ' EB5 () 2 || Defaut Sans Sesf o |~|B I &=
Address

) Record Email - for Salesforce [ Lotus Notes _ O] x|

oy Record Now i3 cancel

Record Options | Email Details |

o

—Search for other records: ———— ltems to be recorded:
I':'F'F'l Go | = To Recipienis:
= Smith, Kns (kns smith@p.com)
E‘ ':f’”tad o @ Record to this item
;’-‘-J: Kopp. Lewis 1 ' Do not record
[=]- Account 3
Flr : Large Opportunity
Modem Media - Poppe Tyson O Lar Sl
= Opportunity
- allred opp
- Allred Opp

- Commerce Opp

- Gravel Oppartunity
- Lange Opportunity
- lehner opp

- My Big Oppartunity
- Quamy Oppartunity

Ready
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The LinkPoint email window is
used to identify how to record the
emalil to salesforce.com.

LinkPoint uses the recipient’s
email address to look up the
Contact to associate the email to.
For each recipient in the emaill,
you can choose “Record to this
item”, “Do not record” or record to
an associated opportunity or case.

You can also choose to store the
email attachments in
salesforce.com or even record to
additional Contacts, Leads,
Accounts, Opportunities or Cases.

Click “Record Now” to send the
email via Lotus Notes and record
the email to salesforce.com or
“Cancel” to return to Lotus Notes.




Ele Edit View Favorites

Salesforce - Enterprise Editi

Tools

Help

rosoft Internet Explorer

QBad( - O - Iﬂ IELI .'_‘J | /._ ) Search \;\'/ Favorites 6‘*

".’«'@ j.i

Address Iﬁj https: ffna1.salesforce. com/0033000000MDwWEl

B | wks >

GO.ngevl

j| |G‘ Search ~ | @ @Ob\ocked | “3}: Check ~ & aAutolink ~

Autofil EOpﬁons P 4

| Global

7|

Search

I
| co |

|Create New...

Advanced Search...

[~ ]

Recent Ttems
Kris Smith
() Large Opportuni
Wilma Flintstone
Dustin Lehman
Glenn Lehner
Bedrock Construction
Ered Flintstone
Quarry O
Gravel O

ortuni
ortuni

E Recycle Bin

Hame

Account

Title
Department
Birthdate
Reports To
Lead Source
Contact Division
Inactive

Contact Type
Mailing Address

Created By
Description

Custom Links

Kris Smith

bedrock inc

CCARE Team Leader

View Org Chari]

Global

BusinessContact

USA

Glenn Lehner, 12/28/2006 3:23 PM

Home Phone

Mobile

Other Phone

Fax

Email

Alternate Email
Assistant

Asst. Phone
Contact Record Type

Other Address

Last Modified By

Glenn Lehner, 2M2/2007 10:36 AM

=

kris.smith@lp.com

Opportunities

Action

Opportunity Name
Edit| Del Large Opportunity

E0
[eee |

Stage

Needs Analysis

Opportunities Help
Amount Close Date

212202007

Cases

No records to display

=

Cases Help

Action  Subject

[ficoe Tock [l e Event]

Related To

Edit | Cls Smith record added

Task
'd 201312007

Due Date Status

Mot Started

Open Activities Hel

Assigned To
Nart Dokhgan

Activity History

Action  Subject

Activity History Help

Related To

Edit | Del test outbound email

Task
v 2122007

Due Date Assigned To

Glenn Lehner

Last Modified Date/Time
2M12/2007 10:40 AM

7

=l

- Y

The email has been recorded in the

salesforce.com History section.
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fa Task: test outbound email ~ Salesforce - Enterprise Edition - Microsoft Internet Explorer

Brought to you by

GENWVATT

Divisions

Global -

Search

Recent Items
mith

& ge Opportunity
Flintstone

Task Detail

Assigned To
Subject

Due Date
Phone
Priority
Created By

Comments

Reminder

Normal
Glenn Lehner,

From: glehner@rdanet com
To: kri nith@|p.com

007 7:40:00 AM

outbound email

atest outbound email
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Setup - Help & Training - Logout
exchange e =

Solutions

Pro

Status

Name

Related To

Email

Type

Last Modified By

uments | Dashb

Completed

Kris Smith

Email

Glenn Lehne 2/2007 10:40 AM

If you “Click” on the emaill,
salesforce.com will display the details of
the message and a listing of all
attachments that were included on the

email.




Step 3

How to record an Inbound email
from Lotus Notes to salesforce.com.
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i) Test User - Inbox - Lotus Notes

File Edit View Create Actions Help

O HE~- TGS BRI T 000E so= BAQ S|
Address l -”J«;}:- v@@,cg-]
I

Welcome I @ Test User - Inbox X]

@ Mall v [New Memo l [ Reply "] [ Reply to All "] [ Faorward "] [ Delete l [ Follow Lp "l [ Folder "] [ Copy Into New ~ :
for Test User

| s | -l Whn |~ Inate Time lsiza | @uhiert

% Inbox (1) * Tom Szabo 07/06/2006 01:23 PM 3.421 Inbound email
[ Drafts
&y Sent

E}? Follow Up
Y2 Junk Mail

fi Trash
Views
[ Folders
57 Tools

=
@
|
=
&
i~
=
S
vl
=

Follow Up~ ElILIJ o

Local Preview

all=m &l rrtad a | [Irtemet wl A al

s select the email in Lotus Notes that you

would like to record to salesforce.com.
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§fl Inbound email - Lotus Notes

IE Edit View Create Actions Help
|CHS- 753 B B|Tee oo%mE 84
I~ 0e -]

o

<tuser@linkpoint360.com>

<tszabo@linkpoint360_com>
07/06/2006 04:46 AM

Inbound email

This is an inbound email.

@
|
=
®
&
=
=
e
=

| | 0 unread documert(s) remaining a||=2 «||xDisconnected | |Intemet ~| 3 =«
— Open the email in Lotus Notes.
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m Record to CRM

File Edit View Create | Actons Help

| CH&S- A&

This is an inbc

Add Redpients 3

Ardhiva [
Cinigont )

send Memo to Uatabase Manager

Synchronize Address Book

Upgrade Folder Design

Edit
Reply
Reply To Al

Forward
Delete

Follow Up
Folder

Copy Into New
Chat

Tools

0% BE g4

CRM Address... v|“¢|v "@@D:‘rl

CRM Send
CRM Send and File
Record to CRM

rwarg «

To
cc
bcc

Lelete || Follow Up = || Folder = || Copy Into Mew = || Chat || Tools =

Ztuser@linkpoint360.com>

Inbound email

Preview In Web Browser

[ ] [ 0 unread document(z) remaining

To record this email to salesforce.com,

- click “Actions”, LinkPoint”, and Record

to CRM”
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§fl Inbound email - Lotus Notes

File Edit Wiew Create Actions Help
=] BoCeonh @M

Address

The LinkPoint email window is
used to identify how to record the
| email to salesforce.com.

o — I

weE .
& RecordNow € Gancel LinkPoint uses the From email

Record Options | Email Detais | address to look up the Contact to

—Search for other records: —————— 1~ ltems to be recerded: . . .-
o - T ——— associate the email to. If it is not

= ‘ cEmEarreTEm  found, it will be listed in the “Emaill
= Lontact - ecord to this item ;
2 © Recordtothis i Addresses not found in

f-‘-nders.nn, Knsta 0 O Do not record
e Ko salesforce.com” section.

Krishna, Suneeva
Krishnamurthy, Umamaheshwaran

g:::::-ﬁ:':kat You can then either add that
Kistiansson, Sigurdurkr Contact to salesforce.com and
:

Venkatakrishnan, Rajan record the email back to that

Contact or search for another
—Email addresses not found in Salesforce ——— Account’ ContaCt’ Lead’ .
tszabo@inkpoint360.com Opportunity or Case to record it to.

Click “Record Now” to record the
Ready . email to salesforce.com or
“Cancel” to return to Lotus Notes.
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Smith ~ Salesforce - Enter

Ele Edit View Favorites Tools Help

Edition - Microsoft Internet Explorer

QBad< - J - |£| |’_'$| ;‘J | /'_-\: Search \;E:JFavoribes 6‘(|

RN

Address I@ https: ffna1.salesforce. com/0033000000MDWEl

HiEERE

Google - I

j| |G search ~ | T Eh0blocked | A Check ~ S fufclink -

Autofil EOpﬁons &

Bedrock Construction Custom Links

=

Fred Flintstone

Quarry Opportuni

Gravel Opportuni “+ ! Opportunities

Action  Opportunity Name

Recycle Bin
E Edit | Del Large Opportunity

E0
=

Opportunities Help
Stage Amount Close Date

Meeds Analysis 212212007

Cases

Mo records to display

Cases Help

=

Open Activities
Action Subject

Edit | CIs Smith record added

= e

Related To Task

Open Activities Help

Due Date Status Assigned To

Vv 21312007 Mot Started Nart Dokhgan

Activity History

Action Subject

Edit | Del Re: Fwd: Another GroupWise Email Account

Related To

Activity History Help

Task Due Date
v' 21212007

Assigned To Last Modified Date/Time

Glenn Lehner 2M2/2007 11:05 AM

Edit | Del test outbound email

v/ 212/2007  Glenn Lehner 21202007 10:40 AM

Campaign History

Mo records to display

rerE——

Campaign History Help

Notes & Attachments

No records to dizplay

Hotes & Attachments Help

~BackTo Top

Home | Campaians | Leads | Accounts | Contacts | Opportunities | Forecasts | Contracts | Cases | Solutions | Products | Reports | Documents | Dashboards |

Copyright ® 2000-2007 salesforce.com, inc. All rights reserved. | Privacy Statement | Security Statement | Terms of Use | Accessibili

Always show me ¥ more records per related list

LPUsers | All Tabs

-
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[T (Bt

The email has been recorded in the
salesforce.com History section.




Contact Information

The LinkPoint email tutorial is now complete.
Please contact us for additional Sales or Support
guestions.

Sales: 732-212-8401
Support: 732-212-8403

E-mail: info@LinkPoint360.com
Web: http://www.linkpoint360.com
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